HIGH COURT OF MADHYA PRADESH : JABALPUR

Endt. No. 563 /Confdl /2017 Dated 1% April, 2017
1-3-121/92 (Pt.-3)

Copy of Letter No. A-11016/1/2017-CLS-ll, dated
08.03.2017 of the Under Secretary to the Government of India, Ministry of
Labour and Employment, New Delhi, along with, enclosures, regarding
vacancy to the post of Presiding Officer in CGIT-cum-Labour Court at

Dhanbad-l is being uploaded for information of all eligible candidates.

Encl: As above.

(MOHD. FAMIM ANWAR)
ﬂBEG|STRAR GENERAL




No. A-11016/1/2017-CLS-II
Government of India

Ministry of Labour & Employment
kkokkkk

Shram Shakti Bhawan, Rafi Marg,
New Delhi — 110001.
Dated 08.03.2017

The Registrar General,
All High Courts.

Sub: Filling up the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial

Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, Dhanbad-I.

Sir,

I am directed to say that the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial
Tribunal-cum-Labour Court (CGIT-cum-LC) at Dhanbad-I is to be filled up shortly in accordance
with the provisions contained in Sections 7 & 7A of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (relevant
extract of the Act placed at Annexure-I). According to these provisions, the post can be held
by a judicial officer who is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court or who has rendered not less
than three years’ service as an Additional District Judge or a District Judge. A serving Judge can
be appointed on transfer on deputation basis for a fixed term. A retired Judge can be appointed
on re-employment basis. The terms and conditions of appointment of a Judge to the post of
Presiding Officer will be as per Annexure-II [The Presiding Officers of the Labour Court,
Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions
of Service) Rules, 2015].

2. The scales of pay attached to the post of Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC are as

follows:
(i) Distt. Judge (Entry Level) - Rs.51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070/-
(i) Distt. Judge (Selection Grade) - Rs.57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210-1540-70,290/-
(iii) Distt. Judge (Super time Scale) — Rs.70,290-1540-76,450/-

3. It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who are willing to be appointed

as Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC, Dhanbad-I and who fulfill the eligibility conditions may

please be furnished so as to reach this Ministry within a period of two months from the date of

issue of this letter for selection of a suitable officer. A set of three (03) proformas (Annexure-

III, IV & V) is to be included with each application. A check-list (copy placed at Annexure-

III) regarding the documents/copies enclosed may be sent with each application. The Bio-

) Data of each of the officers may be furnished in the proforma placed at Annexure-IV to be
Lj"' + filled by the concerned officer and to be attested by the concerned Registrar General. The

C\ , nomination of each of the officers may be forwarded along with an abstract of ACRs (if

\/ applicable to the officer) of the last five years, duly certified in the proforma placed at
Annexure-V, along with verified copies of ACR dossiers and vigilance clearance (if applicable).

[High Court of iadhya Pradesh Continued on Page 2
| JADALFUR, OWO

L1 MAR 2017
Reg No...........g/‘.-.[..é.......

sooipt Cle- &

e Bich .(?.ﬂ,m‘,_t Jd o, ,l e A’C m/}

- R=mp




'S

-2-

4. It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who fulfill the requirements, as
mentioned above and are willing to take up the assignment on terms and conditions mentioned
in the enclosed rules (Annexure-II) may please be furnished to this Ministry along with the
proformas (Annexure-III, IV & V) enclosed with each application.

5. It is requested that filling of details of each of the officers in each of the proformas and
the last date of sending of applications may strictly be adhered to. It is informed that only the
nominations with complete proformas (Annexure-III, IV and V) and verified copies
of ACR dossiers (if applicable) received on/before 07.05.2017 will be considered b
the Ministry. The matter may kindly be treated as urgent.

6. It is further requested that this Circular may be given wide publicity including the Notice
Board of the Court so that there is sufficiently large number of candidates applying for the post.

Yours faithfully,

(S. K. Sirigh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India

Tel. No. 011-23766903
Copy to:

1. Ministry of Law and Justice, Department of Legal Affairs, Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi
with the request that a panel of names of Judicial Officers (retired or serving) who are
willing to be appointed to the post of the Presiding Officer of the CGIT-cum-LC,
Dhanbad-I may kindly be forwarded to this Ministry.

2. All Deputy Chief Labour Commissioners (Central) with the request to take up the matter
with the Registrars of the High Courts concerned for wide publicity of the circular.

3. The Director, NIC, Ministry of Labour & Employment, New Delhi with the request to
upload the circular on the website of the Ministry.

Encl:  Annexure-I, II, III, IV & V.

(S. K. Singh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India




e e i s

§
'
i
§
i
{
|
i
i
m
_
'
i

Sec. 7} The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 19

(2) A conciliation officer may be appointed for a specified area or for
specified industries in a specified area or for one or more specified industries and
either permanently or for a limited period.

5. Boards of Conciliation—(1) The appropriale Government may as
occasion arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Board of
Conciliation for promoling the setilement of an industrial dispute.

" (2) A Board shall consist of a chairman and two or four ocgmn members, as
the appropriate Government thinks fit.

(3) The chairman shall be an independent person and the other members
shall be persons appointed in equal numbers to represent the parties to the
dispute and any person appointed to represent a party shall be appointed on the
recommendation of that party:

Provided that, if any party fails to make a recommendation as aforesaid
within Lhe prescribed time, the appropriate Government shall appoint such
persons as it thinks fit to represent that parly.

(4) A Board, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwilthstanding the
absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its number:

Provided that if the appropriate Government notifies the Board that the
services of Lhe chairman or of any other member have ceased to be available, the’
Board shall not act until a new chairman or member, as the case may be, has
been appointed.

6. Courts of Inquiry. —{1) The appropriate Government may as occasion
arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Court of Inquiry for
inquiring into any matter appearing to be connected with or relevant to an
industrial dispute. )

(2) A Court may consist of one independent person or of such number of
independen! persons as the appropriate Government may think fit and where a
Court consists of two or more members, one of them shall be appointed as the
chairman. . .

(3) A Court, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwithstanding
the absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its
number:

Provided that, if the appropriate Government notifies the Court that the
services of the chairman have ceased to be available, the Court shall not act until
a new chairman has been appoinled.

117.Labour -Courts.—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more Labour.Courts for the.adjudication;”
of-industrial “disputes relating“to-any-matter. specified in the Second Schedule
and for-performing-such.other funclions as may be assigned-to-them-under this ¥
Aet~~

(2)-A-Labour Court shall-consist of.one person only to be appointed by the ~
appropriate Oo<m5~=m:ﬁ

1. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4, for section 7 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Eaclier section 7 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 3 (w.c.f. 26-6-1951). ‘




20 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

(3) A pexson shall not be qualified for m\mwpﬁm-‘ﬁ\nmgmrgnr presiding officer ~

of.a _Labour Court, unless—y

o

i[{a)"_He is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court; or;

mﬂu.mbr.»w;.mmEOb& District Judge; or
NT:= ......... [

3[(d)] he has held any judicial oEnm..E India ,E_ﬁ not less than seven years;
or

(b) he-has, for a period of not less than three_years, been a District ?&.mm »

ZA LY

LN &R AT ARSI TN P NSt SR R SRS

u:w:rmrm.m_xwm:Em?mm..,&bmom.—nmnomm rmwocnho:nﬂnoﬁmmﬂﬁna\
Findér any Provincial Act or State‘Act for not less’than five years.]
4[(f) he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner.(Central) or
Joint- Commissioner of the Stale Labour Department, having a
degree -in-law-and.at least seven years’ experience in the labour
department including three years of experience. as_ Conciliation

S

Officer: =" .
Provided that no such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner or
Joint- Labour Commissianer- shall be appointed-unless-he resigris/
from-theservice-of the Central Government or State Government, as
the case may be, before being appointed as the presiding officer; or]
4(g) he is.an officer of Indian Legal Service in Grade III with three years’
experience in the grade,)™" ™" .

STATE AMENDMENTS
Andaman and Nicobar Islands.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), in clause (a) [now re-
leltered as clause (d)], for the words “seven years”, substitute the words “three years”.
[Vide Regulation 6 of 1964, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 29-4-1964).] .
Goa—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:— ’

Y “(d1) he rummu_dnmmmn_ as an advocale or attorney for not less than seven years in a
High Court or in two or more such Courts in succession, or any Court
subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal or Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force; or

(d2) he holds a degree in w\mi of a university mmsm:m:ma by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Registrar of any Industrail Court or Tribunal or Labour
Court constituted under any law for the time being in force for not less than five -

ears; or

(d3) he holds a decree in law of a university established by law in any part of India

: or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Commissioner of Labour under a State Government or a
Union terrilory administration for not less than five years; or”.

[Vide Goa Act’5 of 1987, sec. 2 (w.ef. 21-10-1987).] H o
Gujarat.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),— ° : e
Ns in clause (b), after the words “Additional District Judge”, insert the words “or a

LTS DN

”,

Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge®; I

(ii) in clause M&\ for the words “seven years” substitute the words “five years”;
. (iii) in clause (e), for the words “five years” subslitute the words “three years” and at

the end of the clause, insert the word “or”;
(iv) after clause (e), insert the following clause, namely:— ;
“(f) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in.a
 High Court or any Court subordinate théreto or in any Industrial Court or
Iny mcmﬂm\_ Tribunal or Labour Court constituted under any law for the time being
in force.” : i : s

Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964).

Clause (c) omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

. Clauses (a) and (b) relettered as clauses (d) and (¢) respectively by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f.
15-12-1964). :

4. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, scc. 4 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

Lol ol ol

g

Sec. 7] o The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 21

{Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 2.]
Haryana.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),—
m« for clause (b), substitute the following clause, namely:— :
“(b) he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
Additional District Judge or; and” . .
(ii) after clause (c), insert Lhe Mmo:ofis clause, namely:—
“(cc) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below Lhe rank of 2 ﬂ<om5»
Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.
[Vide Haryana Act 39 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).]
Madhya Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (1), insert the following sub-section,
namely:— . ’
y “(1A) In addition to the functions specified in sub-section (1), the Labour Court shall
try offences punishable under this Act and the Acls specified in Part B of the
Second Schedule.”

|Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (w.ef. 26-1-1982).]

In section 7, sub-section (1A), as inserted by Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (quoted

_ above), has been omitted.

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Labour Laws (Amendment) and Miscellaneous Provisions Act,
2003 (28 of 2003).]

J\F__wnumrqﬁ.|§ section 7, in sub-section (3), afler clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:—— N .

Y #(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in the
EWWWOCE& or any court subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal
or Labour Court, constituted under any law for the time being in force; or

(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than of Deputy Registrar
of any such Industrial Court or Tribunal for not less than fivg:years; or”.

{Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 2.] )

After clause (d2), insert the following clause, namely:— : !

“(d3) he holds a degree in law of a university esfablished by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower than that of Assistant
Commissioner of Labour under the State Goverrunent for not less than five

“years; or”. s o

[Vide ZmNmEmrﬂm Act 22 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 27-5-1976).]

Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.~—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (b), insert the
following clauses, namely:—

: .A% e is or has been a District Judge; or - : .
(d) he has held the office of the Chairman or any other member of the Labour Appellate

Tribunal constituted under the Industrial Dispytes (Appellate Tribunal) Act, 1950,

or of any Tribunal for a period not less than two years.” .

[Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); Punjab Act 31 of 1966 (w.e.f. 1-11-1966).

Ed. The Luodm said amendments were made prior to the amendmenls made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

«._Em... Pradesh.—In secton 7, after sub-section (3), insert the following sub-section,
namely:— o . p
Y “(3A) In relation to industrial dispute other than that referred to in sub-clause (i) vf

" :clause {a) of section 2.or in section 4 ‘of the Industrial Disputes (Banking and

Insurance Companies) Act, 1949, the provisions of sub-section (3) shail have

effect as if— - L N e . :

(a) after clause (c) the following new clauses (d) and (e) had been added:—

Co _(d) is-or has been a Magistrate of the first class for 2 period exceeding two
ears; : .
(e} ww a person possessing more than two, yedrs! practical experience of
" adjudicating or settling industrial disputes”; * o .
(b) in the proviso after the words “clause (b)” the words “or clause (d) or clause
(e)” had been added”. ST e S e

[Vide Uttar Pradesh Act 25 of 1951, sec. 2 (w.re.f. 26-6-1951).] - :

Ed.—The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the
Central Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964) and Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

West Bengal.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), for'‘clause (p) substitute the following
clause, namely:— R A S

“(b) he’is, or has been, a District _:&mm or an Additional District Judge; or”. -

- [Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 22-1-1989).] T




22 The Industiial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

COMMENTS
Right of ‘Labour Court
The Labour Court/Tribunal has an inherent right in the interest of justice to seek
proper assistance and grant ‘leave’ to a party before it is r mnmmm:"mm by a legal
practitioner; T.K. Varghese v. Nichimen Corporation, (2002) 1V LL} (Supp) Bom 1018.

'[7A #Tribunals.—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification in’.:.

the -Official~ Gazette,~ constityte - one *‘or -more-Industrial.-Tribunals -for-the.
adjudication-of-industrial.disputes relating tg any matter, whether specified .in

the - Second- Schedule-or..the, Third Schedule 2[and for performing such_other
“functions-as-may be-assigned-to- them vinder this"Act]="""~

{2)- A- Tribunal-shall-consist-of-one* person-only-to cozmﬁbebnmufwmegm..

appropriate-Government.
(3) A.person shall.not he gualified for appointment :mmimcm nmm_.nnum officer
of a Tribunal -unless—
(a).~he is, or-has been,-a-Judge of a- High Court; or*~
(aa). he has, for.a period of not less than three-years, been a District Judge
or.an. Additional District-Judge; 4[**]1:. -
mauv .he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or
Joint ..ﬂoagnmmuo:mw of  the State Labour. ep riment,. having .a.

degree in law and at ] least seven years’ experience in the labour

department--including «three- ~years~of ~experienceas~Conciliation

Om_nmh
Provided..that..no. ief Labaur Commissioner.or

Joint Labour. Commissioner--shall.be . appointed unless he resigns
from the service of the Central Government ar State Government,-as-

the case may be, before being wEuo::m& as (he presiding officer; or]

(<) he is"an officer. of Indian Legal Service:in- Dumam E;SE._ E:.mm years’
experience-in-the-grade:]

(4) The" mvvﬂovzmwm‘ﬂod\mﬂ:gman may, if it so 9::6 3 mvvonﬁ two persons..

EbA i Ry -t

as, assessors.to.advise-the Tribunal in the ﬁBnmmn_mevmmo_.m “_: .

STATE AMENDMENTS
b_mr:s.lg section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a) insert the following clause,
namely.—
“{an) he has worked as a District Judge or as an Additional District Judge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years or is qualified for appointment as a Judge
of a High Court:
Provided that the appointment to a Tribunal of any persvoh.qualified Eﬂmn this
clause shall not be made without consultation with the >mmE= wrm: Court; or”.
{Vide Assam' Act 8 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e:f. 30-4-1962).}
mw;ﬁn..lms mmnﬂo: 7A, in sub-section (3), after n_m:mm Amv Smm: the mo:oicam clause,
namely:—- - :
“(aa) he has worked as a District Judge or as an >a&:o:u_ U_msnn ‘Eumm or as both for
a total period of not less than three years:
Provided that the appointment to a Tribunal of any person e.w:mon under this
-clause shall be made in consultation with the High Court of the State in which the
Tribunal has or is intended to have, its usual w_mnm of v;g@ ot”.
[Vide Bihar Act 20 of awmc sec. 2 (w.ef. 7-7-1959).] *

1 Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

2. Ins. by Act 46 of 1982, sec, 4(a) (w.e.f. 21:8-1984).
w.Fu.v<>2wmcm$gmnnpnimm~m 5 50&
»
m

. The word “or” omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
. Ins. by Act 24 0£ 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010). Eatlier clause (b) was omitted by Act 46 Om 1982,
sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
6. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

1

H
1
1
I
*

Sec. 7A] The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 23
Goa.—In séction 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitute the following clauses,
namely:—
“(b) he is, or has been, a District Judge; or
(c) he has, for a period of not less than three years, been an Additional District Judge
. or an Assistant ._c&mm“ or .
(d) he is.qualified for appointment as a Judge of the High Court”.
[Vide Goa Act 5 of 1987, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987).]
O_.:E...:.|_: section 7A, in sub-section (3),—
(i) in clause (aa), afler the words ”an Additional District Judge”, insert the words “or
a Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge”;
(ii) in clause (b) [Ed. clause (b) has been omitled by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)], insert the word “or” at the ‘end;
(iii) after clause (b), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(c) he has for not less than five years been the presiding officer of a Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force”.
[Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 3.]
In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (c), insert, the following clause, namely:—
“(d) he holds a degree in law of a University established by law in any part of India and
is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than that of Assistant
Commissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than ten years”.
[Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1981, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 1-8-1981)]]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
Haryana.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3),—
(i) for clause (aa), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(aa) he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
Additional District Judge; or”; and )
(ii) after'clause (aa), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(aaa) he has been a Comumissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a
Joint Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.
[Vide Haryana Act 39 of 1976, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).]
Kerala—Iu section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (), substitute the following clause,
namely:— .
“(a) he is, or has been, a judicial officer not below Em ..w:.w om a UFEQ Judge, or is
qualified for appointment as a Judge of a High Court; or”.
[Vide Kerala Act 28 of 1961, sec. 2 (wie.f. 27-7-1961)).. .
Madhya Pradesh.—In section 74, for sub-section Gr substitute the mocci.sm sub-section,
namely:—
“(3) A person shall not be qualified mon mEuo::Em:n as the Hunmm_n_:..m OR:..C. of a
Tribunal unless—
(a) he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court; or
(b) he is eligible for being appointed a Judge of a High Court; or
©©  (c) he has worked as President of the Board of Revenue; or ’
(d) he has worked as a an_vmn of the Board of Revenue for a vm:oa_ om not less
© than three years; or
(¢) he has worked as Ooaaﬁv_osm_. of Labour for a period of not _mvw than three
years; or




24 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7A
(f) he has worked as a member of the Indusirial Court constituted under
section 9 of the Madhya Pradesh Industrial Relations Act, 1960 (27 of 1960),

for a period of not less than five years.”

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 19 of 1988, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-1-1989).]

Maharashtra.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “Judge of a
High Court”, insert the words “or a Distvict Judge or a person qualified for appointmenl as a
Judge of a High Court”. .

{Vide Maharashtra Act 2 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 4-1-1963).]

In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (aa), for the words “an Additional District
Judge”, substitute the words “an Additional District Judge or an Assistant Judge or”.

After clause (b), [Ed. Clause (b) has been omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.l.
21-8:1984)], insert the following clause, namely:— '

“(c) he has for not less than five years been a presiding officer of a Labour Court,

constituted under any law for the time being in force.”

[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 3.]

Afler clause (¢) insert the following clause, namely:—

“(d) he holds degree in law of a CE<2m:.< estabtished by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than that of
Assistant Commissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than ten
years.” .

{Vide Maharashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 3.]

Mysore (Karnataka).—(1) In section 7A, in sub-seclion (3), after clause (a), insert the
following clause, namely:—

“(aa) he is, or has been, a District Judge, or”.

{Vide Mysore Act 6 of 1963, scc. 2 (w.e.f. 31-1-1963).]

(2) In clause (aa) as inserted by Mysore Act 6 of 1963, alter the words “District Judge”,
insert the words “for a period of not less than three years.” :

[Vide Mysore Act 25 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-12-1963).]

Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendmenls made by Cen tral Acl
46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984). '

Orissa—In section 7A, in sub-seclion (3), after clause (a), insert the following clause,
namely:— a ' : '

“(aa) he has been a member of the Orissa Superior Judicial Service for a period of not
less than seven years.”

[Vide Orissa Act 6 of 1960, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 17-3-1960).] .

West Bengal.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the wards “High
Court”, insert the words “or a District Judge or an Additional Dislrict Judge”.

[Vide West Bengal Act 17 of 1958, sec. 3 (w.ef. 22-9-1958).]

In section 7A, in sub-seclion (3), for clause (aa), substitued the following clause, namely:—

“(aa) he is, or has been, a District Judge or an Additional District Judge; or”.-

[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 4.] X .

_ . L ‘COMMENTS @ -~ = .=
Power to constitute Industrial Court/Tribunal , s )

Seclion 7A cmpowers the appropriate Government to constitute ‘one or more
Industrial Tribunals for adjudication of the disputes relating to any malter specified in the
Schedules. The Second Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the jurisdiction
of the Labour Court. The Third Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the
jurisdiction of the Industrial Tribunal; Jagdish Narain Sharma v. Rajasthan, Patrike Lid., 1994
LLR 265 (Raj).

Sec. 7C) The Industrial. Disputes Act, 1947 25

I[7B. National Tribunals.—(1) The Central Government may, by nolification

- in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more National Industrial Tribunals for

the “adjudication of industrial disputes which, in the opinion of the Central
Oo<m.~5§m:*.\ involve questions of national importance or are of such a nature
92 5&5".:& establishments situated in more than one State are likely to be
interesled in, or affected by, such disputes. o
(2) A National Tribunal shall consist of one person only to be appointed by
the Central Government. S h
- ® A person shall not be qualified for appointment as the presiding officer
of a National Tribunal ?[unless he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court].
(4) The Central Government may, if it so thinks fit, appoint two persons as
assessors to advise the National Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]

) }7C. Disqualifications for the presiding officers of Labour Courts,
,—,Ev..:s_m and National Tribunals.—No person shall be appointed to, or
noi.:.Em in, the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or
National Tribunal, if— o : .

(a) he is not an independent person; or
(b) he has attained the age of sixty-five years.]
STATE AMENDMENTS
Assam.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following proviso, namely:—
“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
o Océgm:, attains the age. of sixty-five years before the completion of any
- proceedings pending before him, lhe Slate Government may, if in the opinion of
m:n_.a Goverrunent public interést so requires, order his continuance in office for a
. period not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.”
[Vide Assam Act 3 of 1962, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 30-4-1962).] .
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7C, for clause (b), substitute the following
clause, namely:— ,.. C S . : R
“(b) he has attained the age of sixty-seven years”. ) , A

[Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); and the Central Act 31 of 1966.]

West Bengal.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following proviso, namely:—’

: “Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Oo<m.w:5m:~ attains the age of sixty-five years before completion of any proceedings
pending before him, the State Government may, if in the opinion of such
Government public F‘Rmnomw so requires, order his continuance in office for a period
not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.” ‘

[Vide West Bengal Act 11 of 1959, sec. 3 (w.e.f. Nﬂ.Lo.‘Gme )

- t. .- 1. :.. - SECTION 7D .

Gujarat.—After section 7C, inserl the following section, :mBm_v\“l, o

"7D. Certain District Fa.%% qualified for appointments. on Tribynal constituted
by State Government—Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) of
section 7A,— o o ’ R
C..v The State Oo.<m55m:~ may constitute an Industrial Tribunal under that sub-
section for performing such other functions as may be assigned to it under this Act.
) .va Where the m.r&m Government constitutes a Tribunal under section 74, the
. Tribunal may. consist of a person who is, or has been, for a period of not less than
L lns. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (we.f. Ho.u.EmJ. X ’ .
2. 'Subs. by Act.46 of 1982, sec. 5, for certain words {w.e.f. 21-8-1984), -




26 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7C

5 years, a District Judge or an Additional or Joint District Judge and
notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (3) of section 7A but subject to
section 7C, such person shall be deemed to be qualified for appointment as the
presiding officer of the Tribunal.

(3) The appointment of a person qualified under clause (2) shall be made after
consultation with the High Court.”

[Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.ef. 9-8-1962).)

1fg. Filling of .vacancies.—If, for any  reason a vacancy (other -than a
temporary absence) occurs in the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court,
Tribunal or National Tribunal or in the office of the Chairman or any other
member of a Board or Courl, then, in the case of a National Tribunal, the Central
Government and in any other case, the appropriate Governument, shall appoint
another person in accordance with the provisions of this Acl to fill the vacancy,
and the proceeding may be continued before the Labour Court, Tribunal,
National Tribunal, Board or Court, as the case may be, from the stage at which
the vacancy is filled.] .

2[9, Finality of orders constituting Boards, ete—(1) No order of the
appropriate Government or of the Central Government appointing any person as
the Chairman or any other member of a Board or Court or as the presiding
officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or National Tribunal shall be called in
question in any manner; and no act or proceeding before any Board or Court
shall be called in question in any manner on the ground merely of the exislence
of any vacancy in, or defect in the constitution of, such Board or Court.

(2) No settlement arrived at in the course of a conciliation proceeding shall
be invalid by reason only of the fact that such settlement was arrived at after the
expiry of the period referred to in sub-section (6) of section 12 or sub-section (5)
of section 13, as the case may be. ’ )

(3) Where the report of any settlement arrived at in the course of conciliation
proceeding before a Board is signed by the Chairman and all the other members
of the Board, no such setilement shall be invalid by reason only of the casual or
unforeseen absence of any of the members (including the Chairman) of the' Board
during any stage of the proceeding] . .

S[CHAPTER lIA

. , NOTICE OF CHANGE A
. 9A. Notice of change.—No, employer, who proposes to effect any.change in
the conditions of service applicable to any workman in respect of .any matter
mﬁwﬁmmm in the Fourth Schedule, shall effect such change,— : - e
(a) without giving to the workmen EAE,% to be affected by such change
a notice in the prescribed manner of the nature of the change
. proposed to be effected; or : .
(b) within twenty-one days of giving such notice:"
Provided that no notice shall be required for effecting any such change—

1. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 8 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 8 was mzcmmiﬁma
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 4 (wef 26-6-1951). -~ - 0

2. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 9 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 9 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 26-5-1951). -

3. Chapter lIA (containing sections 9A and 9B) ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 6 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

P pr——— vz = e




A«W\Q.}C ure *J]:

v

"_@@ Ho o Telo-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

EXTRAORDINARY
W [[—@US 3 39-WUE (i)
PART II—Section 3 Sub-section (i)
iR | weRTteT

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

€. 275] w3 faeeht, gewafaan, arie 30, 2015/390@ 10, 1937
No. 275] NEW DELHI, THRUSDAY, APRIL 30, 2015/VAISAKHA 10, 1937

A A AR HATAT
gfggET
% fReefl, 6 oo, 2015

arFR. 336(:) —FAT TR, denfis e afaftem, 1947 6 g 38 #1 74T (1) F
@ (1) GTT e ArfRRat T SAT 39 gy Fretata e s g, FAT -—

1. @R A Al e —(1) = Rt 1 |t amw aw e, et srfdraor s T sTferan
(raT, w7 o o= e % Rawer o o) 7w, 2015 €)1

(2) T TrTaF & I TR F ATOG F T G |
2. qReTTT.—(1) 3 Fert & s e B aad & s ufee 7 g —
() “afafage & senfis fare afattaw, 1947 (1947 77 14) Ffa g

(@) "Frerdi afRFrd” & sfgfras & ara 7, ST 7% AT URT 7@ ¥ el o stfgardl & w9
¥ gz st afa g

(2)wsra‘fa~ﬁ'«:qe"rﬁ?,Gﬁﬁﬁwﬁﬁméamqﬁmﬁﬁrﬁ%ﬂ@aﬁﬁuﬂﬁqﬁ%
I Y o & oY S rfafRaw # e 99 |

3. s e e i e sferd F w7 7§ v £ F, giafagfs f srafy
Wﬁa&ﬁ@vﬁaﬁtﬁmﬁﬁmﬁwﬁawﬁﬁgﬁﬁﬁmﬁﬁmw%ﬁm@nﬁl

1926 GI/2015 (0

8



A#\p\_e.)(wr e

,/2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

aq.—(1) Tg wftEor F Horfia st &1 3@ 80,000 =, (Frer) wfwmg 7t g a2 & g
9 foresh st Fama =raeftet K qen F wfRAgRe 99T sk Fartigw =rasiet £ aow & g Soa
e

(2) =\ =raTers A7 SN st F fror sftera &1 daw fe grm —

(i) Forem =maefter (wf3f® ww) - 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070 =.

(ii) fSrer =rrareter (w9 20ft) - 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210 %.

(iii) fSr=m =amarefter (srfaehrer 39) - 70,290-1540-76,450 =.

A ATE F AaT § wwer Gord, Yo qHged A1 o JAraiy F wee f § aR A A

Tg 7 % i sifterdt % v & U s 7 AR a8, S =nfrF 337 a1 97 a7 4w
sng?n"(W)mww%mm%wﬁﬁmﬁaa%sﬂ?ﬁmﬁﬁmﬁﬁ%mﬁﬁﬁﬁaﬁﬁ
F WAL HT I BT E AT AT FT @ Y A1 AW B & g g gy, Frorf st ¥ fow ol
7 399 & g Yo & araT £t WF T F Ry I

5. WIS AAT.—TEra stfdreer 1 Sroreia e #ems s 39 o F I S48 9 359 AT F
AT =rafiert A A |
(2) =\ =TaTerd AT st afdwer F e sfawfat 7 ag auges dgs s 9w = ¥
BRI B ST 1T qFR F T F AN G0 a9q-097 9= srgha fer a7 @1 &
qAt AT fi wafd F dow argfia suwfat & aga m ¥ 9 #% Ry i ¥ od ¥ qerefi
il
6. R ST wAT.—(1) TET srfdreor F i et v o = aRrg@ s 3 g o I
ATATAAT F FATaTeftet w3 |
(2) =¥ wATATErd A ANt fgF, F o afdwiEt F e afoges s ¥y s
G F SOFRET 1 797 7] fAaat F aefiw fafafya &
7. Rl Rame = aftwon F forfi st ¥ Rrg S g ame g £ glRem
I AATAT F AT T Iqersy AT X STgT Hed 1T w@ERA FAT FAAT § ALY §, A9 T ¥ Fediw qan
(Frfarea aferat) faw, 1944 F o wsfea gleie &3 % fro grem 80

(2) = =T At st srfgeor & femEa aftiar ® frg, R gigg = ae@r
& g F ATGFRAT Y FAr AR Fwt F efi Aty g
8. gi—ghm swfda=or ¥ forflw afwiat ¥ oy, gft ¥ d4fda a9y =t ¥ dana
FTarefter Y T97 ITEY B |
(2) == =ATITEd Av st afgFr ¥ fordiv aftmtat & g, gf & 6afte ame w6
TR & THE ‘F ATABIRET AT 797 7] 7wt % srefter Bt 26

9. wwI RRmET w=r—(1) T stfdwer F fierdie st F R G st gataa am-giaer
A1 FATIRATY e aw 7 fi wiera A <X & v Brar = 7 were B o |

(2) =7 =rETEy @7 st s F dorfia st F O =t aw  ag
FHATIAT % FAg o srqarg whrr S st &7 werg B ST |

S



Avnnarure —1

r{mn—@v@ 3] WA &1 TSI : TR P

410, AT ART.— o aferwiat F 3% ARG F g9 9 AT T4 0 A9 gHE F STE AT
AT F gHATT G |
1. gt I R —(1) Tgia st ¥ femfta st F forg Fw=ta awm F agaw 9ft ¥ fag
TAT SR T AT g F forg gt arem R gnt)
(2) =¥ =TT AT e srferaneor & farE arfdaiat F fog gdt amn fama foria sfdwia
Ht qAtaST % e 9 FgRe F araa ara safe Fr aar anp Rt F s ffRafa g
12. 9Tga waT.—(1) TE srferaweor F dorie sfgiat ¥ forg e g g a97 a9g o [AfRfEe
&t TS Faa @H F T0 § arge s i yae FEr S
(2) =% =TT A st afawor F fardia srfeiat 9 ag fBwer g % o 3 amdie
FTAT & TATS & forT €T F1 T a1 79 18 7 7 TFaHTE 92 By v guges ez 9w
Eusicadl
13. TG ATAT HAT—(1) I=AqH o7 F aH GGt & [T g AT 97 gty sheanfs
HTYFTOT AT AR ATAAT FT FTAUGT F9 F AT @R ¥ GeITarg aF i GHGRAT F TH g 0
HEATAY F [ T T HT SITAT@LT ITAT AT T |
(2) == =Ty 4T osenfE aftmor F fee aftwhat § P e aEr
IS #F e 9 AgE ¥ g iata sk F g i g F 7ot o R
AHTT T |
14. afverlt wfsg-ffy Sw—fos affmiat #t aftmrd sEo-ffe = @ fgE F sgar
QATAAISIT &t sTater & S IS 6T g 21T |
15. o7 AT AA.—39 ATAS 1 FTaq s qX § HE srfvrers Iudy Tg a9 TU ¢ sreaer v o7+
geed! ft 947 F RaeET o oqt & gafaa graat f1 F07 aor F Aty F g s =g, denfis
arfreror a1 g srfsreeor grer R g ST, sie et g 1 S o fAfRey aregard gem

16. TRe 7 i afF =07 TR @ 37wt § B sudy 71 et &t a1 vt & srieat 6 ameg
frfae s i arfe gt |

(. Ie-25025/05/2013-Hrusra-2)
ST T, HgFT af=a

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 6th April, 2015

G.S.R. 336(E).—In excercise of the powers conferred by clause (c) of sub-section(l) of Section 38 of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Presiding Officers of the Labour
Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service)
Rules, 2015.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Definitions.—(1) In these rules, unless the context otherwise requires,-

(@) ‘‘Act” means the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 1947);

10



Ay\yw,?(ufe/-:m

4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)] i

N

‘ (6) “Presiding Officer” means a person appointed as presiding officer under Sections 7, 7A or Section 7B
of the Act.

(2) All other words and expressions used and not defined in these rules but defined in the Act shall have
meanings respectively assigned to them in the Act.

3. Duration.—In case of appointment on deputation of serving judges as presiding officer, the normal period
of appointment shall be for a period of three years and in case of retired judges, the appointment shall be till the age of
65 years. :

4. Salary.—(1) The Pay of the Presiding Officer of National Tribunal shall be fixed @ Rs 80,000/- (fixed)
per month and this shall include the deputation allowance in case of serving judges and gross pension in case of retired
Jjudges.

(2) The Salary of the Presiding Officer of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be-
(i) the District Judge (Entry Level) - Rs. 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070
(i) the District Judge (Selection Grade) — Rs. 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210
(iii) the District Judge (Super time Scale) — Rs. 70,290-1540-76,450
per month inclusive of gross pension, penston equivalent or other retirement benefits, if any:

Provided that in the case of an appointment of a person as a presiding officer, who has retired from Judicial
Service or as Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or Joint Commissioncr of the State Government and who
is in receipt of or has received or has become entitled to receive any retirement benefit by way of pension, the pay of
presiding officer shall be reduced by the gross amount of Pension from the Pay so fixed.

|
|
|
5. Dearness Allowance.—(1) The presiding ufficers of National Tribunal shall receive the dearness allowance ;
at the rate as admissible to the serving judges of the High Court.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be entitled to dearness allowance as
applicable to Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government drawing an equivalcnt pay from time to time
subject to the condition that relief of pension is deducted from the emolument drawn during the period of
re-employment.

6 City Compensatory Allowance.—(1) For presiding officers of National Tribunals, the city compensatory
allowance shall be as admissible to the serving judges of High Courts.

(2)  For presiding officers of Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the city compensatory allowance shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group —“A” Officers of the Central Government.

7. Medical Concession.—(1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the Central Government Health
Scheme facilities shall be available at the station of posting and where the Central Government Health Scheme is not in
operation, they shall be entittled to the facilities as provided in the Central Services (Medical Attendance) Rules, 1944.

(2)  For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the medical facilitics shall be regulated
under the rules as applicable to the Group-“ A” Officers of the Central Government.

8. Leave.—(l) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be as
admissible to the serving judges of the High Courts.

(2)  For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government.

9. House Rent Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
rent free furnished accommodation or, as the case may be, the house rent allowance at the rate of thirty per cent of the
basic pay.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, there shall be provided the House
Rent Allowance as admissible to the Group-“A” Officers of the Central Government.

10. Travelling Allowances.—The presiding officers shall be entitled the travelling allowance as per their
entitlement on the rates at the time of their re-employment.




Y[ am 11-Eve 3(i)] ORG T YS9 @ SFHHRT

s 11. Leave Travel Concession.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the leave travel
concession for self and family shall be as admissible to the highest grade in the Central Government.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the Leave Travel Concession
shall be regulated under the rules as applicable to re-cmployed person in respect of Presiding Officers
appointed on re-employed basis.

12. Conveyance Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
the conveyance allowance in the form of a fixed amount to be decided by the Central Government from time to time.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal may have an option either to have a
staff car for official purposes or use of own vehicle with a grant of seventy five litres of petrol per
month.

13. Transfer Travelling Allowance.—(1) The transfer travelling allowance shall be as admissible to a
Government Servant of the highest grade from home town to headquarters for joining the National Industrial Tribunal or
Labour Court and from headquarters to home town at the cnd of the assignment.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the transfer travelling allowance
shall be as per Central Government rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of presiding
officers appointed on re-employed basis.

14. Contributory Provident Fund Scheme.—The presiding officers shall be entitled to join Contributory
Provident Fund Scheme as per rules during the period of re-employment.

15. Other Conditions of Service—Matters relating to the terms and conditions of service of the Chairperson
or other Members with respect to which no express provisions has been made in these rules, shall be referred by the
Labour Court, Industrial Tribunal or National Tribunal to the Central Government for its decision, and the decision of the
Central Government thereon shall be binding.

16. Power to relax.—Thc Central Government have power to relax the provision of any of these rules in
respect of any class or categories of persons.

{No. Z-25025/05/2013-CLS-Il]
DHEERAJ KUMAR, Jt. Secy.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.

A,vmu(u ve =1
-5

1z



Annexure-III

Check-list for each judicial officer to be considered for the post
of Presiding Officer, CGIT-cum-Labour Court, Dhanbad-I

Name of the Officer:

Document Status of enclosure
of document

Y —-Yes

N —No

NA — Not Applicable

Copies of Annual Confidential Reports of the officer
during the last five years

Vigilance clearance of the officer

Integrity certificate of the officer

Annexure-IV
(Proforma for Bio-Data of the Officer)

Annexure-V

(Proforma for ACR Gradings for the last five years of the
Officer)

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General
of the concerned High Court)




Proforma for Bio-data
(to be filled by the judicial officer concerned)

Annexure-1IV

Name (in full)

Date of Birth

Educational Qualification

Particulars of Service in brief with dates of
each appointment held from the level of
Additional District Judge or equivalent post

(In Chronological Order)

(Note: Experience with regard to Labour
matters may be specifically mentioned)

Details Name of the last/current post

in Date of appointment to
respect | jast/current post

of 1ast/  I"pate of retirement
current

post Scale of pay

held Last pay drawn

Address for communication

Phone no. (Office)

(Residential)

(Mobile)

E-mail address

Date:

Place:

Signature:

Name:




(/ Annexure-V

Proforma for abstract of ACR Gradings for the ACRs of the last five years
of each judicial officer to be considered for the post of Presiding Officer,
Central Government Industrial Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, Dhanbad-|

Name of the Officer:

Sl. | Year/Period | Details of Details of | Details of

No. Reporting Reviewing | Accepting
Authority & | Authority & | Authority &
Grading Grading Grading

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General)



	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005
	00000006
	00000007
	00000008
	00000009
	00000010
	00000011
	00000012
	00000013
	00000014
	00000015
	00000016

