HIGH COURT OF MADHYA PRADESH : JABALPUR

Endt. No. 1252 /Confdl. /2016 Dated 13™ December, 2016
11-3-121/92

Vacancy to the post of Presiding Officer at CGIT-cum-Labour
Court at New Delhi-ll as informed by the Under Secretary to the
Government of India, Ministry of Labour and Employment, New Delhi is

being uploaded for information of all eligible candidates.

(MANO& AR MAMTANI)

REGISTRAR GENERAL

Encl: As above.




No. A-11016/4/2016-CLS-1I
. Government of India

Ministry of Labour & Employment
ok skkok ok

Shram Shakti Bhawan, Rafi Marg,
New Delhi — 110001.
Dated the 21% November, 2016
To,
The Registrar General,
All High Courts.

Sub: Filling up the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial

Tribunai-cum-Labour Court, New Delhi-II.

Sir,

I am directed to say that the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial
Tribunal-cum-Labour Court (CGIT-cum-LC) at New Delhi-II is to be filled up shortly in
accordance with the provisions contained in sections 7 & 7A of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947
(extract of the Act placed at Annexure-I): According to these provisions, the post can be held

by judicial officer who is, or has been, a Judge of High Court or who have rendered not less

than three years service as an Additional District Judge or a District Judge. A Serving Judge can
be appointed on transfer on deputation basis for a fixed term. A Retired Judge can be
appointed on re-employment basis. The terms and conditions of appointment of Judges to the
post of Presiding Officer will be as per Annexure-II [The Presiding Officers of the Labour
Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and
Conditions of Service) Rules, 2015].

2. The scales of pay attached to the post of Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC are as
follows:

(i) Distt. Judge (Entry Level) - Rs.51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070/-
(i) Distt. Judge (Selection Grade) — Rs.57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210-1540-70;290/-
(iii) Distt. Judge (Super time Scale) — - Rs.70,290-1540-76,450/-
3. - Itis requested that a panel of names of Judicial Officers who are willing to be appointed

~ as Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC at New Delhi-II and who fulfill the eligibility conditions may

please be furnished to this Ministry within a period of two months from the date of issue of this
letter, for selection of the suitable officer. A set of three (03) proformas (Annexure-III, IV &
V) is to be included with each application. A check-list (copy placed at Annexure-III)
regarding the documents/copies enclosed may be sent with gach application. The Bio-Data of
each of the officers may be furnished in the proforma placed at Annexure-IV to be filled by
the concerned officer and to be attested by the concerned Registrar General. The

nomination of each of the officers may be forwarded along with an abstract of ACRs (if
appIiC}bie to*themfﬁcerr-ofmst five years duly certified in the proforma placed at

} P SR AR 15 W o ©
@89\}7%%’:1@“ with thé AERB0skiers and vigilance clearance (if applicable to the officer).
JlEL ALY Continued on Page 2

Anne

g7 nES 20

== " Rueelph Clepk — b e T e
iﬂiéh Court Selelpor




|

-2-

4, It is _requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who fulfill the
requirements, as mentioned above and are willing to take up the assignment on

terms and conditions mentioned in the enclosed rules (Annexure-II) may please be
furnished to this Ministry along with the proformas (Annexure-III, IV & V) enclosed

with each application.

5. It is urged that filling of details of each of the officers in each of the proformas may
strictly be adhered to. It is informed that the nominations only with complete proformas and
verified copies of ACR dossiers (if applicable) will be entertained by the Ministry. The matter
may kindly be treated as urgent.

6. It is further requested that this Circular may be given wide publicity including the Notice

‘Board of the Court so that there is sufficiently large number of candidates applying for the post.

Yours faithfully,

o

(S. K. Singh)

Under Secretary to the Government of India
Tel. No. 011-23766903

Copy to: :

1. Ministry of Law and Justice, Department of Legal Affairs, Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi
with the request that a panel of names of Judicial Officers (retired or serving) who are
willing to be appointed to the post of the Presiding Officer of the CGIT-cum-LC, New
Delhi-II may kindly be forwarded to this Ministry.

2. All Dy. Chief Labour Commissioners (Cj with the feq~uest to take up the matter with the
Registrars of the High Courts concerned for wide publicity of the circular.

Encl:  Annexure-L, II, III, IV &V, , QA,,\,@/\@
: . W

(S. K. Singh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India

1




A'vmé. xuwre - |

-

TR TR T A s

Sec. 7] The Industrial. Disputes Act, 1947 19

- (2) A conciliation officer -may be appointed for a specified area or for
specified industries in a specified area or for one or more specified industries and
either permanently or for.a limited period. =~ .

5. Boards- of Conciliation.—(1) The wvvno?._vwm Qo<m~:§ma may as
occasion arises by notification in the Official Gazette constituté a Board of
Conciliation for promoting the settlement of an industrial dispute. :

"(2) A Board shall consist of a chairman and two or four other members, as
the appropriate Government thinks fit. .

(3) The chairman shall be an’ Svamsnmi person and the other members
shall’ be persons ‘appointed in equal numbers to represent the parties to the
dispute and any person appointed to nmvnmmmﬂ a ?:Q wrw: be appointed on the
recommendation of that party:

) Provided that,.if any van\ mmbm 8 :Swm a Enogozamsos as aforesaid
within the prescribed time, the wvvnow:m"m Government ‘shall appoint such
persons as it thinks fit to represent that parly. :

(4) A Board, having the prescribed ncoz._nr 93\ m2 notwithstanding the
absence of the chairman .or any of its members or any vacancy in its number:

Provided thatif the appropriate Government notifies the Board that the

services of the chairman or of- any other member have ‘ccased to be available, the”

Board shall not act until a new chairman or member, as the case may be, has

been appointed.

6. Courts of ESEQ ~(1) q.rm mmﬁnovzmﬁ Ooﬁggw may as occasion
arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Court of Inquiry for
inquiring into any matter appearing to be connected with or relevant to an
industrial dispute. .

(2) A Court may consist of one Snmwm:um:ﬁ person or of such number of

‘independent persons as the appropriate Government may think fit and where a

Court consists of two or more Bm_d_oma one of 9@5 shall be mEuoS:wn as the
chairman.

“(3) 'A Court, ._SSnr Em ?.82&3 aco..E? ‘may act sonE:rvE:a:-m.

the absence of the QS:.HEE. or any om its Bm:&mnv or mﬁ% vacancy in its
number: S REL T e

Provided that, if the w@?.omcmwm Qo<m§5m:~ notifies the Court that the
services of the chairman have ceased to be m<E_mEm\ 9@ OcE.— shall not act until
a new chairman has been wvﬁosﬁmm R

1[7:-Eabour-Courts: 1) The ww?.ov:wa Oo<o§.5»2 :SS v< notification
.Enﬁ Omﬂn 1G Nm:@ co aEE one abi judi

>nn ol

Ea,%.onaﬁ&_ne%% »__u

@)-A wdosn.no::-mrmz.«no:w_mn &bﬂn:mmnmoz oa S _.._m s,m%bﬁﬁh by. the:+

S Li'.il iain T

appropria mn00.<m_.:5m=~

1. .Subs, by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4, for mmnccs 7 ?\ ef. 5 -3:1957). mmnrmn section 7. was E:msann
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-6-1951).




o>

of.a Labour Court, unlesg=s-~-——""""

namely:—

The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 : {Sec, 7

LSSt

(3) A person shall not be qualified m;%ﬁﬁ%ﬁgﬁﬁmbﬁmm&pw officer ~

A A rd

![(2) _he'is, or has been, a Judge of m.ﬂmmr .Dmnn.c [s1:3%

R s S

(b) hehas, for 2 period of not less. than thyes ¥ears, been a District Judge

gr.an _Additional District Judge; or

*==1} o - e tl.cl“..ri.{.% - A : .
I()]_he has held any judicial office in India for ot Jegs than seven yeags
) or } - BT IR A AT IR .

3[(¢)]_he has been the presiding officer of a ).abour Court constituted

“Tindér any Provincial ‘Act or State*Act for ‘not Tess' thlan ‘five ‘years.]
[(f) heisorhasbeena Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner.(Central) or
Joint” Cormunissioner of the State Labour Department, having a
degree -in-law..and. at - least seven years. experience in the labour
department including threé_years. of experience as Concilidtion

o._.wmnmn B 2 - T . .
Provided that no such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner or

Joint- Labour Gomumissioner.shall be appointed: unless*he. tesigris/

from-the‘service-of the-Central Government or. State Govexnment, as
.the case may be, bafore being appointed gs the presiding .officer; or]

‘I(g) he is an_officer of Indian Legal Service in Grade T with.three years’
experience in the grade,

ml.ls..%.! i U DN

““STATE AMENDMENTS
Andaman and Nicobar Islands.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), in clause (a) [now re-

e i s )

lettered as clause (d)], for the words “seven ycars”, substitute the words “three ‘years”.

[Vide Regulation 6 of 1964, sec. 2 (w.e.£.204-1964)] - . .. .
Goa—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,

“(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in a
High Court or in two or more such Courts in succession, or any Court
subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal or Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force; or = = T T

(d2) he holds a-degree in «mi of a university established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Registrar of any Industrai! Court or Tribunal or Labour

Court consfituted under any law for the time being in force for not less than five

ears; or - - . .
(d3) he holds a decree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank

than that of Deputy Commissioner o “Labour under a State Government or a
. Union territory administration for riot less than five years; or’.
[Vide Goa Act'5 of 1987, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987 R
Gujarat.—In section 7, in sub-section (3)— 7+ -*i " = R .
i) in clause (b), after the words “Additional District- Judge”, insert the words “or a
* Joint Judge ar an Assistant Judge”; - 7 0 T 0 T )
EW in clause M&. for the words “seven years” substitute the words “five years®;.’
(iii) in clause {e), for the words “five years” subslitule the words “three years” and at
the end of the clause, insert the word “or”; . oo
(iv) after clause (e), insert the following clause, namely:— " - ’
“(f) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in .a
. _High Court or any Court subordinate thereto. or in any Industrial’ Court or
_b.m:mam_ Tribunal or Labour Court eonstituted under any law for the time being
in force.” : : B

1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964).

2. Clause (c) omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

3. Clauses (a) and (b) relettered as clauses (d) and (e) respectively by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f.
15.12-1964). ,

4. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

g e g

o meniqea

P

it ey e i et

Sec. 7] i The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 21

[Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 2.]
Haryana.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),—
m« for clause (b), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(b) he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a District judge or an
Additional District —:m e or; and” - )
(ii) after clause {c), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(cc) he has been 3 Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
‘... ... . .Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a mea
. Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.
" [Vide Haryana Act 39 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).] ’
* Madhya Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (1), insert the following sub-section,
y “(1A) In addition to the functions specified in sub-section (1), the Labour Court shall
"' try offences punishable under this Act and the Acts specified in Part B of the
Second Schedule.” - i
[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-1 -1982).)
In section 7, sub-section {1A), as inserted by Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (quoted
above), has been omitted. ) o ’ :
[Vide Madhya Pradesh Labour Laws (Amendment) and Miscellaneous Provisions Act,
2003 (28 of 2003).] ’ S
: M»wrwnvmrﬂ.».l.g section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (), insert the following clauses,
namely:— . : o .
ey “(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in the
High Court, oc any court subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal
or Labour Court, constituted under any law for the time being,in force; or
(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank.than of Deputy Registrar
of any such Industrial Court or Tribunal for not less than fjyg:years; or”.
[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 2 ! o
After clause (d2), insert the following clause, namely:-- : '

“(d3) he holds a degree in law of 2 universi established by law irv any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower than that of Assistant
Commissioner of Labour under the State Governunent for not less than five

‘years;or. " e C
.- .[Vide Maharashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 27-5-1976).] . o
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (b), insert the
following clauses, namely:— :
: :?M he is or has been a District Judge; or < - ’ - R
(d) he has held the office of the Chairman or any other member of the Labour Appellate
Tribunal constituted under the Industrial Disputes (Appellate Tribunal) Act, 1950,
or of any Tribunal for a’ period not less than two years.” X
© [Vide 1—5&3 Act 8:0f1957, sec. 2 {w.e.f. 3.6-1957); Punjab Act 31 of 1966 (w.e.f.1-11-1966).
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
‘Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984). S :
A.H:wEA Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (3), insert the following sub-section,
namely:— o o IR
Y “(3A) In relation to industrial dispute other than that referred to in sub-clause (i) of
. "clause.(a) of section 2.or in section 4 °‘of the Industrial Disputes (Banking and
Insurance Companies) Agt, 1949, the provisions of sub-section (3) shall have
effectas if— -~ . . R o L !
(a) after clause (c) the following new clauses (d) and (e) had been added:—
_“(d) is-or has been a Magistrate of the first class for a period exceeding two
ears;, . . .
o (e) ww a person possessing more than two years! practical experience of
".." adjudicating or settling industrial dispptes™; "~ " .
(b) in the proviso after the words “clause (b)” the words “or clause {d) or clause

(e)” had been added”. '

[Vide Uttar Pradesh Act 25 of 1951, sec. 2 (w.r.e.f. 26-6-1951).]

Ed.—The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the
Central Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964) and Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

West Bengal.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), for ‘tlause (b) substitute the following
clause, namely'— : M ‘ N

“(b) he'is, or has been, a District Judge or an Additional District Judge; or”.
Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, m»n.m (w.e.f. 22-1-1989).]




\\v

5. e e

+

92 The Industrial. Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7
COMMENTS
iigae of Labour Coust
The Labour Court/Tribunal has an inherent right in the interest cm justice to seek
orope assistance and grant ‘leave’ to a party bafore it is quwn:r\a by a legal
“ractiioner; T.X. Varghese v. Nichimen Corporation, (2002) IV LLj (Supp) Bom 1018.
'7A~Tribunsis~—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification inZ.--
the --Official~Gazette;~constityte - one* ‘or** more<“Industrial-.Tribunals —for-the

z&ﬁuﬁmmﬁ?o?:acwgﬁ- putes xelating tg any matter, whether specified in
the ~-S:cond-Schedule-or _the. ﬂdﬂ Schedule *fand_for nnnow.aEwm. such,_pther.
~functons-as-may be-assigned-to- them™iirid der*this Act]~

(2 A-Tribunal-shafl--consist- cm}cbme person-only-to- vw:wﬂﬁo_bnmnlgrgm
upprcpriate- -Governmenl.
(3 A.person shall.not be_qualifie
of.z Tribunal -unless—
(a).~he is,or-has been,-a-Judge-of -a- High-Court;- sor>
3{(aa)... he has, for a period of not less than three-years, been a OsmmmC:n_mm
or.an Additional District-Judge; 4{*2]}: . -
*[(b) he_is or has been a Reputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or
Joint ,Commissioper  of Ent@mﬁttmﬁuﬁi@n@»ugrtggw A
n_mmgm in (_mzé- and at least seven years’ experience in the labour
department--including :ﬁ%ﬁﬁ.m.somimxvmﬁgn@- -as~Conciliation
Officer:
Provided..that no. such Uwch szgw.ocw Commissjoner .or
Joint Labour Commissioner-shall-be..appointed upless he resigns
from the service of the Central Government or. mnwhﬁﬂoﬁgma as-

the case may he, before being appointed as the presiding officer; or]
I(c) helis g.oﬁﬁmubﬁ:&m:. Legal manﬁnn's OS&?E.§E¢Q$ wmua
experience-in-the-grade’ . R

(4) The~ appropriate-Government may, if it 50 thinks fit, 2 m.%_uoﬁw two_persons:,

M L e e 2

+a3, ASSeSSOTS. »Obaé?gﬁn&:bm_ in the mhonmom_bw _ummown.h ~|t

SR e e L A

STATE Emzugmz.ﬂ 5
Assam.—In section 74, in sub-seclion (3), after clause ?V Emﬁ.w the ?:os..:r a_w:an.
name

d for appointment wm mﬁ vumm_aﬁw -officer

e e S

N\BV he has worked as a District Judge or as an >&n_._wo=n_ U—mﬂ.—n" ?&ww or as conr for
. a total period of not Jess than three years or is ﬁ:mr@mn for 2%05552 um a _smmm
of a High Court:
‘Provided.that.the appointment to a Tribunal of an
-clause-shall not be made without consultation with
. [Vide Assam’ Act 8 of 1962, sec.2 (w.e:f. 30-4-1962).]-
m;ﬁ.. IF annu.oﬁ v> in ucv.wmnuo.. @. mmnmn o_w:mm ?v i
namely:izer et e
:m:v he’ ?..w Eonwna asa USW:# Judge or as-an >nu._wc=n_ U.mn..nn J mmm or as both for
" a total period of not less than %ﬁmn years: '
’ " Provided that the appointment to a Teibunal of any wmnmo: m:m:mmm under this
n_m:hm shall be made in consultation with the High' OoE,n om the: mB.w in which the
" Tribunal has or is intended to have, its :.Em_ Emnm
[Vide Bihar Act 20 of Homo sec. 2 (w,e.f. 7-7- Heuwz .

‘1. _.ﬁ c< Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

2. Ins. by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4(a) (w.e.f. 21-8- 1984);

3. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964).

4. The word “or” omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

5. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010). Earlier clause (b) was omitted by Act 46 of 1982,
sec. 4 (w.e.f 21-8-1984).

6. Ine. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

person. a:»_inn Eﬂmn this
>mm=3 gmr Court; or”,

Ollowing clause,

!
!
I
I
.
t
H
!

Sec. 7A) The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 23
Oen ~—In sgction 7A, in wcw-mnnsou By for n:_:mn (aa), substitlute the ?:oi.:m clauses,
namely;—
“(b) he is, or Fd been, a District _:nmﬁ
(c) he has, for a period of not less than three years, been an Additional District Judge
. or an Assistant Judge; or .
(d) he is.qualified for appointment as a Judge of the High Court”.
[Vide Goa Act 5 of 1987, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987).]
OEE&..|H: section 7A, in sub-section (3),—~
(i) in clause (aa), “after the words “an Additional District _c&rm , insert the io.dm “or
a wo:: Judge or an Assistant Judge”;
(ii) in clause ?v [Ed. clause (b) has beeq omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 {(w.e.f.
21-8-1984)}, insert the word “or” at the n:n
(iit) after clause (b), insert the ~o=c<<5m‘n_m:m$ namely:—
“(¢) he has for not less than five years been the presiding officer of a Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force”. .
[Vide Gujaral Act 28 of 1977, sec. 3.) .
In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (c), insert, the following n_w:mm. namely:—
“(d) he holds a degree in law’of a University established by law in any part of India and
is holding or has held an office npt lower in rank than that of >wma9=n
Commisstoner of Labour under the State Government for not less than ten years”
[Vide Gujacat Act 22 of 1981, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 1-8-1981).]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (wel. 21-8-1984).
Haryana.— [n section 74, in sub-section (3),—
(i) for clause (aa), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(aa) he is quabified for appointment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
>.”EEO-S_ District Judge; or”; and’
" (i) after ‘clause Am& insert the mc:os::m clause, :E.sm_wlu
“(aaa) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the _.msw ofa
Joint Labour Comumissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.
[Vide Haryana Act 39 of 1976, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 12-8- Hcﬂm:
Kerala.—In section 74, in sub-section (3), for clause (a), m:_um:z:ﬁ the mc:oi_bm clause,
namely:— R, .
“(a) he is, or »Em been, a Enrnz: o?amn :2 vw_os the S:r of a U_vc._nn ?nmw. or. is
qualified for wEuoE:.:uE as a Judge of a High Court; or”. . .
[Vide Kerala: Act 287of 1961, sec 2- (wie.f. 27- ?GE& o 5
Madhya _.nwnmm: —In mmnnoz 7A, mo_. mcv.monao: Gv. mcvmuz.:m the aozoi.um sub-section,
namely:—
“(3) A person shall not be m:nrm_ma ?n wvwn.ngmbn as the H:,mm_m:._m O?nn.. of a
Tribunal unless— .
(a) he is, or has been, a FnEm of'a i—mr nc:.nv or’ ’ .
" (b) he is"eligible for being appointed a Judge of a ;mw Court;or -
{c) *he has worked as President of the Board of Revenue; or o
(d) - he has-worked as a member om 5» moﬁ.a of xn<m==m for a per Ba oa not. less
" than three years; or- -~ .- .
(e) he has warked as no.suﬁw&o:mn on ruvocn fora _um:on o». not _m.,rw :5: zﬁmm
years; or




24 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Sec. 7A

(f) he has worked as a member ‘of the Industrial Court constituted under
section 9 of the Madhya Pradesh Industrial Relations Act, 1960 (27 of 1960),
for a period of not less than five years.” . .
. [Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 19 of 1988, sec, 3 (w.e.f. 15-1-1989).]

- Maharashtra.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), n_?ﬂ... the words Q:&mn of a
High Court”, insert the words “or a District Judge or a person qualified for appointment as a
judge of a High Court”. L. : ‘

fVide Maharashtra Act 2 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.ef. ?H-ueaﬂwv._ X : )
mu section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (aa), for the words .:sd >n&:o=»_x District
Judge”, substitute the words “an Additional District Judge or an Assistant Judge or”.
After clause (b), {Ed. Clause (b) has bean omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8:1984)], insert the following clause, namely:— o
wazrm has for not _nwmr.?ﬂ: five years been a presiding officer o,n a Labour Court,
constituted under any law for the time being in force.” :
[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 3]
After clause (c) insert the following clause, :.m:._m_ﬁl. . A
“(d) he holds degree in law of a University established by .m.<< in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank’ than that of
Assistant Comumussioner of Labour under the Stat: Doxmnqﬁ.ﬁ: for not r..wmm than ten
., . years” . - i
[Vide Maharashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 3.] .
Mysore (Karnataka).—(1) In section 7A, in mc?mmm:cs (3), after clause (a), insert the
following clause, namely— )
“(aa) he is, or has been, a District Judge, or”.
[Vide Mysore Act 6 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 31 1-1963).] o )
(2) In clause (aa) as inserted by Mysore Act 6 of 1963, aller the fc_.nm O._mw:nﬁ Judge”,
insert the words “for a period of not less than three years.” - : :
[Vide Mysore Act 25 of 1963, sec. 2 {w.e.f. 12-12-1963).) o
E£d. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendmenls made by Central Act
46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984)." - - R : : :
Orissa—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a), insert the following clause,
namely:— . ° R L S . A
“(aa) he has been a member of the Orissa Superior Judicial Service for a period of nol
less than seven years.” C : S

{Vide Orissa Act 6 of 1960, sec. 2 (w.ef. 17-3-1960).] D e ,
West Bengal—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “High
Court”, insert the words “or a District Judge or an Additional District judge”.
-[Vide West Bengal Act 17 of 1958, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 22-9-1958).] - ]
In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitued the following clause, namely:—
. .-.(aa) heis, or has been, a District Judge or an Additional U»mw.mm_.._numﬁ. .2...:
_S.&uie.mnmn:mm—\rnwumcmGmo.mma. Pu‘ . )

 'COMMENTS @~ =
Power to constitute Industrial Court/Tribunal

Section 7A empowers the appropriate Government to constitute ‘one or more
[ndustrial Tribunals for adjudication of the disputes relating to any matter specified in the
Schedules. The Second Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the jurisdiction
of the Labour Court. The Third Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the
jurisdiction of the Industrial Tribunal; Jagdish Narain Sharmna y. Rajasthan Patrika Lid., 1994
LLR 265 (Raj)-

oy =

ey v

g e

F N

Sec. 7C) ) The Industrial Disputas Act, 1947 25
'

1{7B. National Tribunals.~—(1) The Central Government may, by notification

. in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more National Ind istrial Tribunals for

the adjudication of industrial disputes which, in the opiion of the Central

Government, involve questions of national importance or ¢te of such a nature

that industrial establishments situated in more than one Sate are likely to be
interested in, or affected by, such disputes. ’

" (2) A National Tribunal shall consist of one person only to be appointed by
- the Central Gavernment. ’ . ' I '

(3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as he presiding officer
of a National Tribunal ?[unless he is, or has heen, a Judge of a High Court].
. (4) The Central Government may, if it so thinks fif, appoint two persons as
assessors 'to advise the National Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]

"1[7C, Disqualifications for the presiding officers of 'Labpur Courts,
Tribunals ‘and ' National Tribunals.—No person shall bz appointed to, or
continue in, the office of the presiding officer of a Labou: ‘Court, Tribunal or
Natlional Tribunal, if— -

>

(a) he is not an independent vm._.moP. or .
(b) he has attained the age of sixty-five years.]

'STATE AMENDMENTS
Assam.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following provis:, namely:—

“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunz ! appointed by the State
Government ‘attains the age of sixty-five years before 'he completion of any
, - proceedings pending before him, the State Government may, if in the opinion of
. such Government public interést so requires, order his coi tinuance in office for a

. period not exceeding six months for completion of the priceedings,” =
‘_S%>§Bv.auc:w%;npu?.m.»ua-»._u%.:A‘ _

i~ ‘— .
" Punjab, Haryana, .Q-wb&.w%#ﬁkg section 7C, for clause (b), {ubstitte the following
clause, namely:-- Sl T .. T R

“(b) . he has mnm,_ﬂ.—n,& Em.n,mm qf ,m.m..x»K..Mm.\n: years”. - ch e

" [Vide Punjab ‘Act 8 of-1957, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); and 9».0«::»& >nn«wﬁ. of 1966 * -

West Bengal.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following mmnoimo. namely:— """
“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribun4; appointed mw the State
Goverrunent attains the age of sixty-five years before complgtion of any proceedings
pending before him, the State Government may, if iry the opinion of such
Govemment public interest so requires, order his continuarfce in office for a period
.. . not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedinfis.” )
~<En<<mm~mnbmu_>2:.o:mmm\mnn.mAS:CNN.B..GMS.._

o to + et S SECTION 7D .
Gujarat.—After section 7C, insert the following section, namely:d- .- -

“7D. Certain District Judges qualified for appointments jon Tribynal constituted
by State Government.—Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) of
section 7A— S ” R : ! ft SuP ;

© (1) The State Government may constitute an Industrial Tribunal under that sub-
section for performing such other functions as may be mmm_.mm_ma to it under this Act.
(2) Where {he State Government constitutes a Tribunal under section 7A, the
Tribunal may consist of a person who is, or has been, for a period of not less than

1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). i
2. ‘Subs. by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 5, for certain words (w.e.f. 21-8-1984}

!
1

i




R

St a———]

R AT W "

e v

ey~ e« e

-

s

et T LU mp———

26 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7C

‘5 years, a District Judge or an .Additional. or. Joint District Judge. and
notwithstanding anything contained in gub-section (3) of section 7A but subject o’
section 7C, such person shall be deemed to be qualified for appgintment as the

presiding officer of the Tribynal. . L - e

(3) The appointment of a person qua

: *" consultation with the High Court.”

- [Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 9-8-1962).]"

n::unn clause @ shall .vmw.ai.m,ﬁm after

* g, Filling of -vacancies.—If, -for -any-'feason. a- vacancy (other -than a
temporary absence) occurs in the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court,
Tribunal ‘or’ National Tribunal or-in the:office of the Chairman or. any other
member of a Board or Court, then, in.the case of a National. Tribunal, the Central
Government and -in any other case, the appropriate Government, shall appoint .
another person in.accordance with the provisions of this Act'to fill the vacancy,
and the proceeding may be’ continued before the Labour ‘Courf, Tribunal,
National Tribunal, Board or Court, as the case may be, from the stage at which
the vacancy isfilled.] ™ o ST e e alee D

2[9, Finality of orders constituting Boards, ‘etc—(1) No ‘otder ‘of the
appropriate Government or of the Central Government appointing any person as
the Chairman or any other member of‘a’Board or Court’or as the presiding
officer of a.Labour Court, Tribunal-or National Tribunal shall becalled in

" question in any-manner; and no act or proceeding before any'Board or Court

shall be called in question in any manner on'the ground merely of the existence
of any vacangy in,.or defect.in the constitution of, such.Board or. Court.
-+ (2) No settlement artived at in the course:of a congiliation proceeding shall
be invalid by reason-only of the fact that such’settlement was arrived at after the
expiry of the period referred to in:gub-sectipn (6) of section 12-or sub-section (5)
of section 13, as the case may be. ..o =¥ g g T B e

~ {3) Where the report of any settlement arrived at in the course’ of conciliation
proceeding befere a Board is sigried by the’Chairman‘and all the other'members
of the Board, no such settlement shall be invalid by reason only of the casual ‘or
unforeseen absence of any of the members (including the Chairman) of the'Board

during any stage of the proceeding] ~~ "'
e YCHAPTER “lIA-
NOTICE, OF CHANGE =~ =~

- ..9A. Notice of change.—No, employer, who proposes. to nmnn.p.wu..dx change in
the conditions of service applicable to' any workman.in respect of any matter
specified. in the Fourth Schedule; shall effect-such change/~=; . +: v -

(a) without giving to the workmen likely to be affected by such change
"a notice in the prescribed manner .of the. nature, of the..change
- proposed to be-effected;-or ... - .o sawr o
“(b) - within twenty-one days of giving such otice:”
, Provided that.no natice shall be requi “effecting any such change—

1.” Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec.'5, for section 8 (w
T by Act40 of 1951, sec.d (W.e.f. 26-6-1951).5 '« - A
2. Sibs. by Act 367of 1956, sec. 5, for section 9 (wie.f. 10-3-1957).-Earlier section 9 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 26-5-1951).. . T

:.quw,wmﬂ Earlier ma‘azbm_‘ 8'was substituted

3. Chapter IIA (containing sections 9A and 9B) ins, by .\.r,ﬁ,.;,wo c,n.,ﬂw.mm\. .mn..n.. .m..ﬂf..m.h 10-3-1957).

AP o

T e ey e e

RS ——




Amnwwré -—I 8

=T Ho Eto UHo-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

azelte of India

STETHNOT
EXTRAORDINARY
WA [[—WUE 3 IT-TUE (i)
PART II—Section 3 Sub-section (i)
WUEHR § YTy
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

dq. 275) 73 Toeelt, SEwiiEr, el 30, 2015/39m@ 10, 1937
No. 275] - NEW DELHI, THRUSDAY, APRIL 30, 2015/VAISAKHA 10, 1937

HqH SR ASFIR HATH
afegT
7% Reefl, 6 51w, 2015 | | | ‘
m.%r.ﬁ. 336(ar).—HtT qFR, tenfiw R sfafam, 1947 f oy 38 ) 9g-amy (1) ¥

S (M) BT 9= AT T SE 1T g Rt R aedt g, st —

1. wRw A 8K sRew—(1) 57 RaEt &1 w6 s A, senfie sl s g st

(AT, W ST g qar F Faraw i ad) Few, 2015 8 |
(Z)ﬂmﬁsﬁ%wm%mﬁ"@r%m@?ﬂ - : )

2. v&wmrq.—ﬁ)%?ﬁwﬁﬁaaﬁ%wﬁ%mmsﬁﬁﬁr@:—

| ($)“arfaﬁw'%aﬂa‘tﬁﬁmﬁwsﬁaﬁw,1947(1947m14)a¢f¢@-<r§;’

() “Froreft sftrr” & s oy sy 7, et 79 7 ey 7 3 s o s e
3 Frges safir o 2

(2) 37 st AR 4= ¥, S 37 Fawt F vy & qur ofenfa 7 § wig affey § afenfie @
I gt o § Y I arfafRew § wwen %

3. wrdHe R FaRa Frefter i forew afdwrd & v § s f g §, vRfghs £ ey
FreTOTerT i W A gAY iR Fargw A £ qar § Ry fus o€ £ arg a F Rro e

1926 G1/2015 ‘ , m




|

3

S R o 2 R R R R R R R

A«,\y\e_xure.. —'j:[

2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

4. aaw.—(nrrgﬁwfawamﬁmﬁwmmmamso,oooa(ﬁmmﬁﬁmaa-@m

3ﬁ‘<ﬁmﬁ%ﬁaﬁa@amrwﬁ&ﬁﬁamﬁ?ﬁ?ﬁgﬁﬁwaﬁtﬁmﬁzﬁmﬁﬁaﬁamﬁwﬁw
gt

(2) = =Ty AT SR srfircor 3 e R o R 2T

(i) oo =raefter (wfaf® w=) - 51 ,550-1230-58,930;1 380-63,070 =.

(ii) foretT =rmamefier (s Sroft) - 57,700-1230-58,930-1 380-67,210 %.

(iif) FSrem =arrefter (srfashrer &) - 70,200-1540-76,450 5. |

T AT F Fa7 H @er ge, e G AT e Iy Fwrd i E AR A

Ttgagf%tﬁsm%arfém%wﬁirﬁar%ﬁﬁgﬁﬁiﬁa&nﬁ,Gﬁmﬁ%ﬁmmwa@aw
W(W)mmw%éﬁm%w%ﬁaﬁﬁgsﬁtﬁzﬁﬁwﬁﬁﬁmﬁwﬁ@aﬁqﬁr

% BT TH- T AT T AR < £ AT wor - forg geram & g, e sftwrd ¥ R @

ﬁwﬁﬁwﬁsﬁ%mﬁwwmﬁmm!

5. mw.—mmﬁwwmwwa%wﬁﬁmm%
qATC T AT »
(2) 9 e A1 R st F ot wfwREt F 9 wqer TS sy O 0 ¥
m@ﬁa}%ﬁﬁuw%mﬁ‘%’a@wﬁﬂmw-mwmﬁmmwgﬁ
g?d?m‘mﬁﬁmﬁr%aﬁmaﬂgﬂamﬁaﬁﬁwﬁm%mwﬁqaﬁ%ﬁ%mmﬁw
gt | - | |

6. Waﬁmw.anréha%w%%wﬁaaﬁw&ﬁﬁagwﬁwwéw@mﬁﬁ :
RICIERIE ERIRICIEG KRR

(2) = =T A shenf sftw, F fordie aftmRat ¥ ww sfige s F gy
Hﬁ?’ﬂ%ﬁ'ﬁﬁ%qmmﬁﬂﬁ%ﬂﬁ?%ﬁ?ﬁﬂﬁﬁl
7. WW.—W@@W%WW%WWWWWWE&W
wﬁ:éﬁ%mwmﬂ@ﬁﬁtw#ﬁwwmmwﬁﬁ% agl I F FET AT
(Frfarcar afaf) 194413&@73@%13%%?%%%%@%! '
(2) =9 =T AT S fF srfder H ferha s ¥ fig, rfacar gfaey F=hy aeFwr
%m'm’w%&ﬁﬁammﬁuﬁ%mﬁ?ﬁﬁwﬁﬁﬁ?ﬁs

8. @.—WW%WW%W@@%W@HW@W%W
FTFEREr F TAT TTE Y

(Z)awmmmsﬁaﬁmaﬁmw%maﬁm&ﬁ%%mg@%ﬁ%ww
W%m‘waﬁw&a‘iaﬁwmwﬁwﬁ%mﬁ#%ﬁwﬁ?@%l

9. WWW.—(UWW@W%WW%%QWWWW{%%
maﬁﬁw%mﬁﬁ&mﬁaﬁm%wwﬁaﬁmmt

(2) = waTaTer SR ShERfiE S % e s ¥ B e e ¥ g

Wﬁﬁ%%qwma@wwfﬁmwwﬁa%mml




A‘ nneXrE —'_II:

1 S [ SFT [I-87% 3(i)] R T TIH 2 STHIUR 3

10. ITAT AAT—TISTEIA ATHRIRAT T ITh (AT F GHT I AR A G 9T gHET o AL AT _ ]
T % ThEC B | ‘
11. g 7 R —(1) Tt arfdee ¥ frowhie st & Ry e e F agan 40 ¥ R
AT AR T X FgF & forg gt ar Ramara geft
(2) =9 AT SR e st & forda afdwiat ¥ forg gt am Rarga derhw sfgwhat
N qAHESE F ara ax Rgie & araa iR saie @ e ey Rt & afia Gt g
12, ATE WeT—(1) T srfeeeer & fowlla Afershriat & forg e e gra auy gy 9 ARt
&1 7S e T & ¥ § 918 99T #1 yay o s |
(2) == =T A7 SRRE aferer & ey sfemiat v ag fAwew o & a1 3 aedry
FTAT % TATSI & 7T TeT% X TG IT 399 918 T TIRT IfawTg T2 &y v g=gex et iger
TRT |
13. TATHIAT AT WAT—(1) I=9a¥ v F gL gt & forg se@g saEia<or 9497 g =S
FATTFT AT FH AT FT FEUG T & A AR § JeaTad a5 X GHIRT & GHI giv I
HEATAT & [ AL T T TATATTLT ATAT HAT G |
(2) =% w7 sdEnfE afgsr F dordw afgwal e e am=r 9w
e gATRSE F arET 9= R % atag @i it F R ST g F garan RaE
ET G |
14. WW%W—WW%WWWW%W%W
Wﬁm%aﬁwﬁwgﬂ?@ml
15. Wﬁmﬁ—mmﬂﬁﬁwﬁﬁaﬁﬁﬁ%mmaaﬁmw%amamm
aeElt ft qar F Pt i aqt § @ iia At 31 w6 qe § e F g am amwe, denfis
srfeyeneor a7 gt s grer e frg smad, o g ae &1 39 W AR aregsrd g

16. ﬁrﬁawﬁﬁmﬁ&—ﬁvmaﬁaﬁuﬁ%%ﬁﬁa%%ﬁaﬁmm%mﬁmﬁﬁm
farfarer < & afRR i1

. . [‘éf. Fe-25025/05/201 3-%11'@@-2]

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
[ , : New Delhi, the 6th April, 2015

G.S.R. '336(E).—In excercise of the powers conferred by clause (c) of sub-section(1) of Section 38 of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules, namely:—

| 1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Presiding Officers of the Labour
| Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service)
Rules, 2015.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Definitions.—(1) In these rules, unless the context vtherwise requires,-

(a) “‘Act’” means the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 1947);




Amex we — 1

4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(2)]

(b) “Presiding Officer” means a person appointed as presiding officer under Sections 7, 7A or Section 7B
of the Act.

(2) All other words and expressions used and not defined in these rules but defined in the Act shall have
meanings respectively assigned to them in the Act.

3. Duration.—In case of appointment on deputation of serving judges as presiding officer, the normal period
of appointment shall be for a period of three years and in case of retired judges, the appointment shall be till the age of
65 years.

4.  Salary.—(1) The Pay of the Presiding Officer of National Tribunal shall be fixed @ Rs 80,000/ (fixed)
per month and this shall include the deputation allowance in case of serving judges and gross pension in case of retired
judges.

(2) The Salary of the Presidihg Officer of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be-
(i) the District Judge (Entry Level) - Rs. 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070
(i) the District Judge (Selection Grade) — Rs. 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210

(i) the District Judge (Super time Scale) - Rs. 70,290-1540-76,450

per month inclusive of gross pension, pension equivalent or other retirement benefits, if any:

Provided that in the case of an appointment of a person as a presiding officer, who has retired from Judicial
Service or as Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or Joint Commissioner of the State Government and who
is in receipt of or has received or has become entitled to receive any retirement benefit by way of pension, the pay of
presiding officer shall be reduced by the gross amount of Pension from the Pay so fixed.

5. Dearness Allowance.—(1) The presiding officers of National Tribunal shall receive the dearness allowance
at the rate as admissible to the serving judges of the High Court.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be entitled to dearness allowance as
applicable to Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government drawing an equivalent pay from time to time
subject to the condition that relief of pension is deducted from the emolument drawn during the period of
re-employment.

6 City Compensatory Allowance.—(1) For presiding officers of National Tribunals, the city compensatory
allowance shall be as admissible to the serving Judoes of High Courts.

(2) For presiding officers of Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the city compensatory allowance shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group —“A” Officers of the Central Government.

7. Medical Concession.—(1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the Central Government Health
Scheme facilities shall be available at the station of posting and where the Central Government Health Scheme is not in
operation, they shall be entittled to the facilities as provided in the Central Services (Medical Attendance) Rules, 1944.

(2) For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the medical facilities shall be regulated
under the rules as applicable to the Group-“ A” Officers of the Central Government.

8. Leave.~(l) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be as
admissible to the serving judges of the High Courts.

(2)  For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government.

9.  House Rent Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
rent free furnished accommodation or, as the case may be, the house rent allowance at the rate of thirty per cent of the
basic pay.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, there shall be provided the House
Rent Allowance as admissible to the Group-“A” Officers of the Central Government.

10. Travelling Allowances.—The presiding officers shall be entitled the travelling a]lowance as per their

entitlement on the rates at the tithe of their re-employment.




Anex e =1

(s I-Evg 3(i)] YRE T TSUT : STHYURY . 5

11. Leave Travel Concession.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the leave travel
concession for self and family shall be as admissible to the highest grade in the Central Government.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the Leave Travel Concession
shall be regulated under the rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of Presiding Officers
appointed on re-employed basis.

12. Conveyance Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
the conveyance allowance in the form of a fixed amount to be decided by the Central Government from time to time.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal may have an option either to have a

staff car for official purposes or use of own vehicle with a grant of seventy five litres of petrol per
month.

13. Transfer Travelling Allowance.—(1} The transfer travelling allowance shall be as admissible to a
Government Servant of the highest grade from home town to headquarters for joining the National Industrial Tribunal or
Labour Court and from headquarters to home town at the end of the assignment.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the transfer travelling allowance

shall be as per Central Government rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of presiding
officers appointed on re-employed basis.

14.  Contributory Provident Fund Scheme,—The presiding officers shall be entitled to join Contributory
Provident Fund Scheme as per rules during the period of re-employment.

or other Members with respect to which no express provisions has been made in these rules, shall be referred by the

Labour Court, Industrial Tribunal or National Tribunal to the Central Government for its decision, and the decision of the
Central Government thereon shall be binding,.

16.  Power to relax.—The Central Government have power to relax the provision of any of these rules in
respect of any class or categories of persons.

[No. Z2-25025/05/2013-CLS-I1]
DHEERAJ KUMAR, Jt. Secy.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- | 10064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.

- -—=15,~~Other Conditions of Service.—Matters relating to the terms and conditions of service of the Chairperson =" = "7 -




B

Annexure-III

Check-list for each judicial officer to be considered for the post
of Presiding Officer, CGIT-cum-Labour Court, New Delhi-II

Name of the Officer:
Sl. | Document Status of enclosure
No. of document
Y -—Yes
N —No
NA — Not Applicable
1 Copies of Annual Confidential Reports of the officer
during the last five years
2 Vigilance clearance of the officer
3 |Integrity certificate of the officer
4 Annexure-IV
-~ | (Proforma for Bio-Data of the Officer)
5 Annexure;v | :
: (Proforma for ACR Gradings for the last five years of the
Officer) '

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General

~ of the concerned High Court)




Annexure-1V

Proforma for Bio-data
(to be filled by the judicial officer concerned)

Name (in full)

Date of Birth

. |1 Educational Qualification

Particulars of Service in brief with dates of
each appointment held from the level of |
Additional District Judge or equivalent post '

(In Chronological Order) ‘

(Note: Experience with regard to Labour
matters may be specifically mentioned)

Details | Name of the last/current post

In Date of appointment to ‘
respect | |ast/current post ‘ : &
of 1ast/  I'bate of retirement ‘ A

current _ _

post Scale of pay , ‘
held Last pay drawn

Address for communication

Phone no. (Office) -
| (Residential)
(Mobile)
E-mail address '
Date: , Signature: .
Place: Name:
&
o |




|5
Annexure-Y
Proforma for abstract of ACR Gradings for the ACRs of the last five years of each

judicial officer to be considered for the post of Presiding Officer,
Central Government Industrial Tribunal-cum- -Labour Court, New Delhi-Il

 Name of the Officer:

Sl. | Year/Period |Details of . | Details of | Details of

No. Reporting Reviewing | Accepting
' Authority & | Authority & | Authority &

Grading Grading Grading

1

|12

3

4

5

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General)




	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005
	00000006
	00000007
	00000008
	00000009
	00000010
	00000011
	00000012
	00000013
	00000014
	00000015
	00000016

